
 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Dr. Ed Gould, Superintendent/President 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Gloria Carmona, Director of Admissions/Records 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Efrain Silva, Dean of Economic and Workforce Development 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: February 3, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

 



IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Tina Aguirre, Associate Dean of Nursing 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 12, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Becky Green, Director of CFCS 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Tina Aguirre, Associate Dean of Nursing 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 12, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Carols Fletes, Director of Fiscal Services 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Frances Beope, Counselor 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Dr. Taylor Ruhl, Associate Dean of Learning Services 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 12, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Norma Nunez, Matriculation Director 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Edward Wells, P.O.S.T Coordinator 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Gonzalo Huerta, Dean of Applied Sciences/Career Technical Education 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Efrain Silva, Dean of Extended Campus 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Ted Ceasar, Associate Dean of Disabled Student Programs & Services 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Jan Magno, Dean of Financial Aid and State Programs 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

 
 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Gail Parrish, Financial Aid Technician/Veterans 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
Please review the attached pages from the current General Catalog, and note any changes that 
should be made for 2010 - 2011, if any.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and 
date below and return the memo with the attachment to Linda Amidon by Friday January 
29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 



 

 

 
 
 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Mary Bell, Payroll/Benefits Coordinator 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
Please review the attached Emeritus Faculty page from the current General Catalog, and note 
any changes that should be made for 2010 - 2011, if any.  Whether or not changes are made, 
please sign and date below and return the memo with the attachment to Linda Amidon by 
Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Michael Heumann, English/DE Coordinator 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 12, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Dave Drury, Chair, and Exercise Science/Wellness/Sport 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Sergio Lopez, Associate Dean of Student Affairs, Professor 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Jim Mecate, Athletic Director 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
 
 
 



 

 

 
IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 

Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO: Travis Gregory, Associate Dean of Human Resources 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 



 

 

IMPERIAL VALLEY COLLEGE 
Office of the Vice President for Academic Services 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
 
 
TO: Carol Lee, Director of Transfer Center 
  
FROM:  Kathy Berry, Vice President for Academic Services 
 
DATE: January 11, 2010 
 
SUBJECT:    2010 – 2011 General Catalog  
            
 
We are in the process of developing the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  You are receiving this 
memo because you have been identified as the person responsible for maintaining the 
section(s) of the catalog shown on the attached pages.  If this is not the case, please notify 
Linda Amidon immediately so that she can refer this memo to the appropriate individual. 
 
If you are the person responsible for the subject section(s) of the catalog, please note any 
changes that should be made for the 2010 – 2011 General Catalog.  Please submit changes in 
both printed and electronic format.  Whether or not changes are made, please sign and date 
below and return the memo with the attachment(s) to Linda by Friday January 29, 2010. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and assistance.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
or Linda. 
 
 
 
KB:eja 
 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

 
□ See Changes Attached 
 

□ No Changes 
 
 
 
            
 Signature        Date 
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